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PIERS, HARBORS & LAKEFRONT COMMITTEE 

WEDNESDAY, OCTOBER 16, 2019 – 5:30PM 

CITY HALL, CONFERENCE ROOM 2A 
 

AGENDA 
 

1. Meeting called to order by Chairman Skates 
2. Roll Call 
3. Approval of Minutes from September 18, 2019 meeting as prepared and distributed 
4. Comments from the public limited to 5 minutes, limited to items on this agenda  
5. Harbormaster’s Report 

a. Planning for 2020 buoy/slip mass mailing 
 

6. MSI Update regarding: 
a. Riviera roof 
b. Riviera windows 
c. Riviera tuck-pointing  

 
7. Discussion/Recommendation regarding clean boats/clean water grant application 
8. Discussion/Recommendation regarding a Commercial Buoy & Boat Slip Agreement with 

Gage Marine 
9. Discussion/Recommendation regarding a Commercial Buoy & Boat Slip Agreement with 

Lake Geneva Boat Line 
10. Discussion/Recommendation regarding a Commercial Buoy & Boat Slip Agreement with 

Terry Johnson d/b/a Marina Bay Boat Rental  
11. Adjournment 
 

This is a meeting of the Piers, Harbors & Lakefront Committee. 
No official Council action will be taken; however, a quorum of the Council may be present. 

     cc: Aldermen, Mayor, Administrator, Harbormaster, Media 

City of Lake Geneva 
626 Geneva Street 
Lake Geneva, WI 53147 
(262) 248-3673 
www.cityoflakegeneva.com 
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Members: Chairperson Doug Skates, Shari Straube, John Halverson, Rich Hedlund and Tim Dunn 
 
Meeting called to order by Chairman Skates at 5:54 pm  

 
Roll Call: Chairperson Doug Skates, John Halverson, Shari Straube, Rich Hedlund and Tim Dunn.   
 
Approval of Minutes: Hedlund so moved to approve the minutes of August 14, 2019, Halverson 
seconded.  Motion carried 5-0 
 
Comments from the public limited to 5 minutes, limited to items on this agenda  
 
Dick Malmin, 1991 S. Lakeshore Drive   addressed the topic of starry stonewort and the city’s 
interaction with the Geneva Lake Environmental Agency (GLEA). 
 
Harbormaster Report:  Interim Harbormaster Donna Crook was absent (excused) from 
tonight’s meeting.  City Administrator Nord reported that the new Harbormaster would be 
selected by the end of the week and that the new appointment would be trained by Donna Crook, 
before taking over full responsibility for the position. 
 
Riviera Restoration Project Update:   
Adam Wolfe (MSI) presented the committee with sample images of the Riviera building using 
high definition images.  This software will allow the committee and (MSI) to generate alternative 
floor plans for the building in a smaller amount of time.  MSI has also been in contact with the 
State’s preservation agency to review what types of building modifications will and will not be 
allowed.  It was stated that Ann Krogstad of MSI will be at the October, 2019 committee 
meeting. 
 
Roof Replacement Request for Proposals: 
Adam Luterbach (MSI) presented the committee with the five proposals that were received.  
Luterbach provided an overview of each proposal and answered questions from the committee.  
MSI stated that would provide the committee with an amount for their services related to 
overseeing the project.    Due to the lack of responses, MSI moved the deadline for proposals for 
tuck pointing and glass replacement to October 2, 2019 at 10am.  After additional discussion 
Hedlund so moved to accept the proposal submitted by Renaissance Roofing.  Halverson 
seconded the motion.  Motion carried 5-0.  This motion was forwarded to the FLR Committee. 
 
Starry Stonewort Update:  
Chairman Skates addressed the committee to advise them that recent social media comments 
concerning the City’s interactions with the GLEA are false.  Skates advised that committee that 
there is no shared service agreement between the communities of Geneva Lake.  Skates provided 
an update as to what was actually happening to address the starry stonewort issue. 
 
Harbormaster position update: 
City Administrator stated he had nothing additional to add above what he reported earlier in the 
meeting under the Harbormaster’s report. 
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Discussion / Recommendation regarding clean boats / clean water grant application:  
Chairman Skates advised the committee that he would work with Administrator Nord to identify 
those grants the City should pursue on its own as well as any grants that might be better applied 
for with other area communities. 
 
Future Meeting Topics: 
 
1. One year extension to the current three (3) commercial slip and buoy agreements the city has  

with private operators. 
 

2. Final report from outgoing Harbormaster Donna Crook 
 
3.  Year-end report from the Riviera Beach Manager 
 
3.  Discussion on possible 1st and 2nd Floor renovation opportunities at the Riviera 
 
4.  Proposal results for glass replacement and tuck-pointing at the Riviera  
   
 
Adjournment: 
Tim Dunn so moved to adjourn at 6:58 pm, second by Halverson. Motion carried 5-0. 
 
 
 

 
 



 

Cedar Roofing Connoisseur FJA Christiansen Hanson Interstate Knickerbocker Langer Millen Nofke Rennaissance Vandehey

No Bid 410,125.00$         Not Bidding No Bid Not Bidding -$                       523,240.00$         No Bid No Bid 483,905.00$         543,850.00$         
(doesn't fit (booked thru 
schedule) spring)

Excluded By Others By Others Excluded Excluded

Included 72,000.00$           Included Included Included

Included 26,000.00$           Included Included Included
Included 14,000.00$           Not Included Included Included
Included 9,000.00$              Included Included Included
Included 5,000.00$              Insp. And Repair Inspect-Repair Insp-Repl-$7,500
Included 4,500.00$              Included Included Included

Included 14,000.00$           Included Included Included
Included By Others Included Included Reroute 1

Included 16,000.00$           Incl.(see scope) Included Included
Included 18,000.00$           Incl.(see scope) Included Included
Included 368,000.00$         Included Included Included

Included 7,000.00$              Included Included Included

Scaffold Scaffold, Snow Removal Repl. Flat Seam Scaffold
Saddles remain Other Trades Winter Cond. Scaffolding Conc. Protect.
Gutters remain Winter Cond.

-$                       410,125.00$         Not Bidding -$                       Not Bidding 553,500.00$         523,240.00$         -$                       -$                       483,905.00$         543,850.00$         

1,000.00$              4,800.00$              5,618.00$              4,950.00$              1,650.00$              
500.00$                 3,000.00$              5,778.00$              No Bid No Bid

4 saddles $103k

$2.50 per sf $15.00 per sf T&M (see attach) $15.00 per sf No Bid
$90.00 per hr $134 per hour See Exhibit G $129.00 per hour No Bid

-$                       411,625.00$         Not Bidding -$                       Not Bidding 561,300.00$         534,636.00$         -$                       -$                       488,855.00$         545,500.00$         

x x x x x x

? 25 25 25 25

? 25 25 25 25

50 35.5 40 45 38

0 50 0 0 0 85.5 90 0 0 95 88

Unit Price #2 - Labor rate(s) for additional unscheduled work

Total Score - Maximum of 100 Points   

Cost - (50%) - Maximum of 50 Points

Experience - (25%) - Maximum of 25 Points

Qualifications - (25%) - Maximum of 25 Points

Acknowledge of Addendum #1 (x)

880,000.00$                               

Scoring Summary - Based on 100 Maximum Points

2018 Budget Estimate
Subcontractor

880,000.00$                               

880,000.00$                               

Inspect and replace roof sheething/decking - (assume 15%)
Reflash roof to the clerestory walls/windows

Alternate #3

Unit Price #1 - Cost per sf for additional sheathing/decking repair

Total Adjusted Bid Amount Including Alternates

Adjusted Bid Amount

Excluded From Proposal:

Alternate #1 - Remove guttering from clerestory roof
Alternate #2 - Repair/reinstall four (4) flag poles (flag poles by others)

Snow and ice guards-north elevation @ stairs/south elevation @ balc.

Install Ice and Water Shield at valleys, eaves, etc.
Install underlayment - 2 layers organic or 1 layer 43 lb. modified bitum.
New clay tile roof and accessories

Riviera Building - City of Lake Geneva
Proposal Form - Roof Replacement - Option A - Clay Tile
 September 18, 2019

                                                            

Description

Base Proposal Amount

Included in Proposal:
Scaffolding of perimeter of building

Inspect/replace at flat copper valley/seams
Remove/replace vents as needed

Inspect/clean/repair guttering
Reroute roof drain leaders at south balcony

Remove existing concrete tile

Inspect and remove underlayment



Cedar Roofing Connoisseur FJA Christiansen Hanson

No Bid 231,030.00$         Not Bidding No Bid
(doesn't fit 
schedule)

Excluded

Included

Included
Included
Included
Included
Included

Included
Included

Included
Included
Included

Included

Scaffold
Saddles Remain
Gutters Remain

-$                       231,030.00$         Not Bidding -$                       

1,000.00$              
500.00$                 

$2.50 per sf
$90.00 per hr

-$                       232,530.00$         Not Bidding -$                       

Riviera Building - City of Lake Geneva
Proposal Form - Roof Replacement - Option B - Concrete Tile
 September 18, 2019

                                                            

Description

Base Proposal Amount

Included in Proposal:
Scaffolding of perimeter of building

Inspect/replace at flat copper valley/seams
Remove/replace vents as needed

Inspect/clean/repair guttering
Reroute roof drain leaders at south balcony

Remove existing concrete tile

Inspect and remove underlayment
Inspect and replace roof sheething/decking - (assume 15%)
Reflash roof to the clerestory walls/windows

Alternate #3

Unit Price #1 - Cost per sf for additional sheathing/decking repair

Total Adjusted Bid Amount Including Alternates

Adjusted Bid Amount

Excluded From Proposal:

Alternate #1 - Remove guttering from clerestory roof
Alternate #2 - Repair/reinstall four (4) flag poles (flag poles by others)

Snow and ice guards-north elevation @ stairs/south elevation @ balc.

Install Ice and Water Shield at valleys, eaves, etc.
Install underlayment - 2 layers organic or 1 layer 43 lb. modified bitum.
New concrete tile roof and accessories

675,000.00$                               
2018 Budget Estimate

Subcontractor

675,000.00$                               

Unit Price #2 - Labor rate(s) for additional unscheduled work

675,000.00$                               



x

?

?

50

0 50 + ? 0 0

Scoring Summary

Total Score   

Cost - (50%)

Experience - (25%)

Qualifications - (25%)

Acknowledge of Addendum #1 (x)



 

Interstate Knickerbocker Langer Millen Nofke Rennaissance Vandehey

Not Bidding No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 459,880.00$         No Bid
(booked thru 
spring)

Excluded

Included

Included
Included
Included
Insp and Repair
Included

Included
Included

Included
Included
Included

Included

Repl Flat Seam
Scaffolding

Not Bidding -$                       -$                       -$                       -$                       459,880.00$         -$                       

4,950.00$              
No Bid

$15.00 per sf
$129.00 per hour

Not Bidding -$                       -$                       -$                       -$                       464,830.00$         -$                       



x

25

25

40

0 0 0 0 0 90 0



 

Ackman Glass Corcoran Glass Glass Works Heritage Glass Home Glass Jefferson Glass Krull Window Lurie Companies Milwaukee Plate Omni Glass & Omni Late
Paint

$420,240.00 $721,083.00 $416,685.00

Excluded Included
Excluded Included

Included
Included
Included
Included

Allow $4,500 ea No Bid Included

Allow $4,500 ea No Bid Included

Included
Included
Included

Entry doors
Arched doors

$420,240.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $721,083.00 $0.00 $0.00 $416,685.00 $0.00

$13,800.00 $55,000.00 $30,003.00
$36,000.00 No Bid 3,000 per leaf

Not applic. No Bid

$105 per hr $145 per hour See Proposal

$470,040.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $776,083.00 $0.00 $0.00 $446,688.00 $0.00
Late

X X X

X X X

X X X

Incidental wood blocking as needed                                                             

Riviera Building - City of Lake Geneva
Proposal Form-Glass & Glazing-Option A-Historic Glass
 October 2, 2019

Description

Base Proposal Amount

Included in Proposal:
Demolition/removal of existing windows and doors/dumpsters by others

1st Floor arched storefront/doors at concourse SF-1 on north and south

2nd Floor doors to Ballroom - rectangular doors with arched transoms

                                      
Clerestory window replacement - W1 and W1A per Window Schedule
2nd Floor Ribbon Windows RW-1 thru RW-5 incl. break metal at sill
2nd Floor punched window replacement  - W-2 thru W-5
1st Floor punched window replacement - W-6 thru W-14

Alternate #3 - Cost for additional vertical mullions in 2nd Floor ribbon

Unit Price #1 - Labor rates for additional requested work

Total Adjusted Bid Amount Including Alternates

Adjusted Bid Amount

Excluded From Proposal:

Alternate #1 - Cost to enlarge 1st Floor windows by lowering sill 
Alternate #2 - Cost (or allowance) for aluminum doors on 1st Floor 

Flashings as needed for complete installation
Breakmetal at sills of ribbon windows
Caulk and sealants

2018 Budget Estimate
Subcontractor

375,000.00$                               

Acknowledge of Addendum #1

Scoring Summary

Total Score   

Cost - (50%)

Experience - (25%)

Qualifications - (25%)



 

Ackman Glass Corcoran Glass Glass Works Heritage Glass Home Glass Jefferson Glass Krull Window Lurie Companies Milwaukee Plate Omni Glass & Omni Late
Paint

$229,705.00 No Bid $186,800.00

Excluded Included
Excluded Included

Included
Included
Included
Included

$4,500 Each Included

$4,500 Each Included

Included
Included
Included

Entry Doors
Arched Doors

$229,705.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $186,800.00 $0.00

$5,880.00 $25,500.00
$36,000.00 $3,000 Per leaf

$5,500.00

$105 per hour See Proposal

$277,085.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $212,300.00 $0.00
Late

X X

X X

X X

Incidental wood blocking as needed                                                             

Riviera Building - City of Lake Geneva
Proposal Form-Glass & Glazing-Option B-Storefront  Glass
 October 2, 2019

Description

Base Proposal Amount

Included in Proposal:
Demolition/removal of existing windows and doors/dumpsters by others

1st Floor arched storefront/doors at concourse SF-1 on north and south

2nd Floor doors to Ballroom - rectangular doors with arched transoms

                                      
Clerestory window replacement - W1 and W1A per Window Schedule
2nd Floor Ribbon Windows RW-1 thru RW-5 incl. break metal at sill
2nd Floor punched window replacement  - W-2 thru W-5
1st Floor punched window replacement - W-6 thru W-14

Alternate #3 - Cost for additional vertical mullions in 2nd Floor ribbon

Unit Price #1 - Labor rates for additional requested work

Total Adjusted Proposal Amount Including Alternates

Adjusted Proposal Amount

Excluded From Proposal:

Alternate #1 - Cost to enlarge 1st Floor windows by lowering sill 
Alternate #2 - Cost (or allowance) for aluminum doors on 1st Floor 

Flashings as needed for complete installation
Breakmetal at sills of ribbon windows
Caulk and sealants

2018 Budget Estimate
Subcontractor

$275,750.00

Acknowledge of Addendum #1, #2 and #3

Scoring Summary

Total Score   

Cost - (50%)

Experience - (25%)

Qualifications - (25%)



Advanced ARI Cornerstone Holton Bros. MRI Rennaisance
Restoration

$630,380.00 $1,224,000.00 $753,453.00

$13,785.00
Included Included $41,716.00 Included
Included Included $18,245.00 Included

Included Included $14,588.00 Included
Included Included $11,250.00 Included

Included Included $5,480.00 Included

Included Included $9,740.00 Included
Included Included $122,658.00 Included

Included Included $57,856.00 Included

Included Included $9,350.00 Included

Included Included $788.00 Included

Included Included $17,985.00 Included
Included Included $27,996.00 Included
Included Included $74,575.00 Included
Included Included $21,588.00 Included

Remove/replace Dutchman band Fix E - 612' - per precast plans Included Included $126,832.00 Included

$630,380.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,224,000.00 $574,432.00 $753,453.00 $0.00 $0.00

$39,500.00 $98,750.00 $46,320.00 $43,925.00
$6,462.00

See Attached $85 + Mater. $82.50 per hr + 129.00 per hour
$57 per Brick $28.75 per Brick $38 per Brick

$669,880.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,322,750.00 $627,214.00 $797,378.00 $0.00 $0.00

X X X X

Riviera Building - City of Lake Geneva
Proposal Form - Tuckpointing - Option A - All Inclusive - Per Addendum
 October 2, 2019

Powerwash/brick clean of entire building with water or eco friendly                                                             

Description

Base Proposal Amount

Included in Proposal:
General tuckpointing of building - 30% to be tuckpointed

South wall repair - Balcony side - Remove/replace brick and caps
South wall repair - Dock side - remove/replace 100% brick facing

Remove/repl. brick with correct match on north elevat. at entry stairs

Remove/repair deck coating of south balcony - Incl. fill of low spot
Underside repair of concrete at south balcony - 100 sf to be included

Brick enclosures of 2 roof drain leaders - 2'-8" x 2'-0" cmu/brick

Alternate #3

Broken or chipped brick repair - Include - 300

Wall Cap A - 254' - Clean, patch and Thoroseal or other
Remove/replace Wall Cap B - 145' - per precast plans

Front Entry Steps Repair - 2 Nosing repairs = 4 sf; 45' of crack repair

Unit Price #1 - Labor and material rates for additional work if requested
Unit Price #2 - Unit price for remove/replace brick

Total Adjusted Proposal Amount Including Alternates

Adjusted Proposal Amount

Alternate #1 - Demo/repair to modify 1st Floor wndws per A-204
Alternate #2 - *Add for Labor and Perf. Bond for MRI

Remove/replace Sill Cap C - 246' - per precast plans
Remove/replace Window Sill D - 110' - per precast plans

Excluded From Proposal:

2018 Budget Estimate
Subcontractor

$819,250.00

Acknowledge of Addendum #1

Scoring Summary

Total Score   

Cost - (50%)

Experience - (25%)

Qualifications - (25%)



Advanced ARI Cornerstone Holton Bros. MRI Rennaisance
Restoration

$296,210.00 $608,450.00 $308,980.00

$13,785.00
Included Included $32,740.00 Included
Included Included $18,245.00 Included

Included Included $14,588.00 Included
Included Included $7,880.00 Included

Included Included $5,480.00 Included

Included Included $8,750.00 Included
Included Included $108,644.00 Included

Included Included $6,500.00 Included

Included Included $788.00 Included

Included Included $17,985.00 Included
Included Included $27,996.00 Included

Remove/replace Dutchman band Fix E - 612' - per precast plans

$296,210.00 $0.00 $0.00 $608,450.00 $263,381.00 $308,980.00 $0.00 $0.00

$39,500.00 $98,750.00 $46,320.00 $43,915.00

See Attach $85 per hour + $82.50 per hr + 129 per hour
$57 per brick $28.75 per Brick $38 per brick

$335,710.00 $0.00 $0.00 $707,200.00 $309,701.00 $352,895.00 $0.00 $0.00

X X X X

Riviera Building - City of Lake Geneva
Proposal Form - Tuckpointing - Option B - Moderate Work - Per Addendum
 October 2, 2019

Powerwash/brick clean of entire building with water or eco friendly                                                             

Description

Base Proposal Amount

Included in Proposal:
General tuckpointing of building - 20% to be tuckpointed

South wall repair - Balcony - Remove/replace caps; 100% tuckpt brick
South wall repair - Dock side - rem/repl brick to top of arches

Remove/repl. brick with correct match on north elevat. at entry stairs

Remove/repair deck coating of south balcony - Incl. fill of low spot
Underside repair of concrete at south balcony - 100 sf to be included

Brick enclosures of 2 roof drain leaders - 2'-8" x 2'-0" cmu/brick

Alternate #3
Unit Price #1 - Labor and material rates for additional work if requested
Unit Price #2 - Unit price for remove/replace brick

Total Adjusted Proposal Amount Including Alternates

Adjusted Proposal Amount

Alternate #1 - Demo and repair as required to lower sill - 1st Floor windows
Alternate #2

Remove/replace Sill Cap C - 246' - per precast plans
Remove/replace Window Sill D - 110' - per precast plans

Excluded From Proposal:

Broken or chipped brick repair - Include - 200

Front Entry Steps Repair - 2 Nosing repairs = 4 sf; 45' of crack repair

Remove/replace Wall Cap B - 145' - per precast plans

$731,900.00

Scoring Summary

2018 Budget Estimate
Subcontractor

Wall Cap A - 254' - Clean, patch and Thoroseal or other

Total Score   

Cost - (50%)

Experience - (25%)

Qualifications - (25%)

Acknowledge of Addendum #1, #2, #3



Advanced ARI Cornerstone Holton Bros. MRI Rennaisance
Restoration

$232,673.00 $412,550.00 $287,599.00

$11,785.00
Included Included $19,322.00 Included
Included Included $18,245.00 Included

Included Included $14,588.00 Included
Included Included $7,880.00 Included

Included Included $5,480.00 Included

Included Included $7,780.00 Included
Included Included $57,760.00 Included

Included Included $3,500.00 Included

Included Included $788.00 Included

Included Included $17,985.00 Included
Included Included $27,996.00 Included

Remove/replace Dutchman band Fix E - 612' - per precast plans

$232,673.00 $0.00 $0.00 $412,550.00 $193,109.00 $287,599.00 $0.00 $0.00

$39,500.00 $98,750.00 $46,320.00 $43,915.00

See Attached $85 per hr + $82.50 per hr + 129 Per Hr
$57 per Brick 32.50 per brick $38 per brick

$272,173.00 $0.00 $0.00 $511,300.00 $239,429.00 $331,514.00 $0.00 $0.00

X X X X

Wall Cap A - 254' - Clean, patch and Thoroseal or other

Total Score   

Cost - (50%)

Experience - (25%)

Qualifications - (25%)

Acknowledge of Addendum #1

Scoring Summary

2018 Budget Estimate
Subcontractor

$514,100.00

Brick enclosures of 2 roof drain leaders - 2'-8" x 2'-0" cmu/brick

Alternate #3 - 

Unit Price #1 - Labor rates for additional requested work

Total Adjusted Proposal Amount Including Alternates

Adjusted Proposal Amount

Alternate #1 - 
Alternate #2 - 

Remove/replace Sill Cap C - 246' - per precast plans
Remove/replace Window Sill D - 110' - per precast plans

Excluded From Proposal:

Broken or chipped brick repair - Include - 100

Front Entry Steps Repair - 2 Nosing repairs = 4 sf; 45' of crack repair

Remove/replace Wall Cap B - 145' - per precast plans

Riviera Building - City of Lake Geneva
Proposal Form - Tuckpointing - Option C - Minimal Work - Per Addendum
 October 2, 2019

Powerwash/brick clean of entire building with water or eco friendly                                                             

Description

Base Proposal Amount

Included in Proposal:
General tuckpointing of building - 10% to be tuckpointed

South wall repair - Balcony - Remove/replace caps; 50% tuckpt brick
South wall repair - Dock side - tuckpt 100% brick in lieu of replace

Remove/repl. brick with correct match on north elevat. at entry stairs

Remove/repair deck coating of south balcony - Incl. fill of low spot
Underside repair of concrete at south balcony - 50 sf to be included
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